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HENDAYA FENG SHUI

Yin-yang energy
 L'Eliana, Valencia

El Carme Hendaya is one of the best residential areas in
La Eliana for its location surrounded by nature and a very
close to the town of La Eliana and its restaurants and
leisure areas and San Antonio de Benageber. Easy access
to schools, close to the tennis club and sports clubs.

Precio

730.000 €
Finca

840 m2
Propiedad

356 m2

Habitaciones

7
Baños

3
Pool
48

Flowing energy
This unique property unites Asian tradition with a quiet
environment without neglecting even the smallest detail.
The construction style is based on Feng-Shui and
separates the day and night areas so that the energy flows
in a balanced way. The vertical and horizontal furniture,
the colors, the intensity of the light and other variables
that are taken into account in this space to get the most
out of it.
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Space and design
The house has a large living-dining room and a kitchen
with a terrace and views of the beautiful landscape. On the
ground floor we also have a Philip Starck bathroom and
two bedrooms. A beautiful solid wood staircase to the
upper part of the house with a main room with a dressing
room and two more rooms. In the basement there is an
independent apartment with bathroom and kitchen, ideal
for hosting guests. It can also be used as a playroom or
gym. The house has a large plot with a 48m2 pool, chill
out area, covered summer terrace and barbecue.
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